

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/19/2005 Report: PS1 DFS: DOL: 3.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: TVD: Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 1,853,033 Cum Cost: 1,853,033 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Rigging up

24hr Summary: Spot rig & rig up

24hr Forecast: Rig up

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:00	24.00	N	MIRU	01	MOVING : Prep rig from 2005/02/08 to 2005/02/12 . Start moving 2005/02/12 Ensign # 55 from Devon Tommy d-B65-J/94-G-9 to mile 101 on the Alaska hwy. At 101 break down rig & load out to move to K-58 w / Mullen . Moved out rentals on the 2005/02/14 NOTE : pls. see break down on Remarks Tab

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 02/20/2005 Report: PS2 DFS: DOL: 4.00
 Spud: RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: TVD: Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 89,092 Cum Cost: 1,942,125 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Finish rig up

24hr Summary: Rig up

24hr Forecast: W.o. well license

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:00	24.00	N	MIRU	02	RIG UP

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 02/20/2005 Report: PS2 DFS: DOL: 4.00
Start: End:

Remarks

Rig up , instal diverter system & finish rig up.

NOTE : Safety meetings -> Man down drill w / both rig crews & all on location .

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/21/2005 Report: PS3 DFS: DOL: 5.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: TVD: Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 55,862 Cum Cost: 1,997,987 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: W.o. well license
 24hr Summary: Finish rig up & w.o. well license
 24hr Forecast: W.o. well license

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 08:00	8.00	N	MIRU	02	RIG UP
08:00 - 00:00	16.00	N	MIRU	83	WAITING OTHER : W.o. well license

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 02/21/2005 Report: PS3 DFS: DOL: 5.00
Start: End:

Remarks

Finish rig up , mud loggers & geo. W.o. well license .

NOTE : W.o. well license from 2005/02/21 @ 08:00hrs.

NOTE : Did mandown drill w / both rig crews & b.o.p. drills

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/22/2005 Report: 1 DFS: 1.00 DOL: 6.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 14.0 (m) TVD: 14.0 (m) Progress: 14.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 0.25 AV ROP: 56.00 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 52,290 Cum Cost: 2,050,277 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Dilling ahead 311mm surface goole @ 24mkb

24hr Summary: W.o. well license , spud @ 21:45hrs. 2005/02/22 . Drill ahead 311mm surface hole to 14m . Work on Chimo not geting data

24hr Forecast: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 08:00	8.00	N	MIRU	83	WAITING OTHER : W.o. well license
08:00 - 09:00	1.00	N	MIRU	90	SAFETY MEETING & b.o.p. drill w / crew & mandown drill
09:00 - 20:00	11.00	N	MIRU	83	WAITING OTHER : W.o. well license
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	N	MIRU	90	SAFETY MEETING : prior to spud & b.o.p. drill w / all on location
20:15 - 21:45	1.50	N	MIRU	17	C & C - DRILLING : circ , mix gel & wt. up mud system all morning
21:45 - 22:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : Spud 311mm surface hole @ 2005/02/22 @ 21:45hrs. Drill ahead 311mm hole from 0m to 14m
22:00 - 23:15	1.25	N	S-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR : change screens & fix stroke counter on mud pumps
23:15 - 00:00	0.75	N	S-DRL	53	3RD PARTY REPAIR : Work on Chimo not geting data to Mud Loggers

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

DEVON CANADA CORPORATION

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/23/2005 Report: 2 DFS: 2.00 DOL: 7.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 95.0 (m) TVD: 95.0 (m) Progress: 81.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 13.25 AV ROP: 6.11 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 202,201 Cum Cost: 2,252,478 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: p.o.o.h. sideways to r.i.h. openended to run a cmt. plug from 100m to 50m
 24hr Summary: Work on Chimo (not tracking depth & pumps service hand on the way) . Drill ahead 311mm hole from 14m to 95m . Lost circ. pu
 24hr Forecast: Ream , drill & run cmt. plug for lost circ.

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
00:15 - 02:30	2.25	N	S-DRL	53	3RD PARTY REPAIR : work on Chimo : its not tracking depth , pump output & pump strokes (CHIMO service hand on the way)
02:30 - 08:00	5.50	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole from 14m to 32m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test HCR
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING : Devon hand book sec. 7.2 & 7.7
08:30 - 16:15	7.75	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm hole from 32m to 95m
16:15 - 16:45	0.50	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY : accum.
16:45 - 19:15	2.50	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : Lost circ. @ 95m , mix LCM pill x 3 pump down annulus
19:15 - 20:00	0.75	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : wiper trip hole to condition
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING : function Annular
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE
20:30 - 00:00	3.50	O	S-DRL	40	REAMING : from 30m to 39 m , build volume & mix gel & barite

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/24/2005 Report: 3 DFS: 3.00 DOL: 8.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 100.0 (m) TVD: 100.0 (m) Progress: 5.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 0.50 AV ROP: 10.00 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 39,852 Cum Cost: 2,292,330 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Drilling out surface plug @ 80mkb
 24hr Summary: Ream f. 39m to 95m , drill ahead 311mm surface hole w/ no returns f. 95m to 100m . P.o.o.h. run cmt. plug #1 f. 100m to 0m, w.
 24hr Forecast: Drill out cmt.

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE
00:15 - 03:00	2.75	O	S-DRL	40	REAMING : from 39m to 95m
03:00 - 03:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole w / no returns from 95m to 97m
03:15 - 04:15	1.00	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : build volume
04:15 - 04:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole w / no returns from 97m to 100m
04:30 - 07:15	2.75	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h. sideways & pick up d.p. to run cmt. plug
07:15 - 09:00	1.75	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : build volume
09:00 - 10:00	1.00	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : finish r.i.h. to bottom 100m
10:00 - 10:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING w / rig crew & Sanjel crew
10:15 - 10:45	0.50	O	S-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON : run plug # 1 from 100m to 0m . Cmt. : 16t / 12m3 of 0:1:0'G'+2%cacl-2+Lcc1
10:45 - 11:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h.
11:00 - 15:15	4.25	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT : w.o. plug to set
15:15 - 15:45	0.50	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : r.i.h. & bridge off @ 39m
15:45 - 16:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
16:00 - 17:15	1.25	O	S-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON : plug # 2 from 39m to 0m
17:15 - 17:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h.
17:30 - 20:00	2.50	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT : laydown d.p. out of stick & make up b.h.a.
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : Function test Annular
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:30 - 00:00	3.50	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/25/2005 Report: 4 DFS: 4.00 DOL: 9.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 115.0 (m) TVD: 115.0 (m) Progress: 15.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 4.25 AV ROP: 3.53 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 231,005 Cum Cost: 2,523,336 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Plug # 3 down @ 04:45hrs. W.o.c.

24hr Summary: Drill out cmt. & drill ahead 311mm surface hole w / parcial & blind circ. f. 100m to 115m . P.o.o.h. to run plug # 3 . Rig up Sanjel t

24hr Forecast: Flush pumper , run plug # 3 . W.o.c.

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test Annular
00:15 - 08:00	7.75	O	S-DRL	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT : drill out cmt. plug from 28m to 100m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test HCR
08:15 - 09:45	1.50	O	S-DRL	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT : finish drilling out cmt. plug
09:45 - 10:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : displace hole to mud
10:00 - 10:45	0.75	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : lost circ. build volume
10:45 - 13:00	2.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : drill ahead 311mm surface hole bind / parcial circ. from 100m to 106m
13:00 - 16:15	3.25	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : circ. hole mix mud while wiper tripping to 14m
16:15 - 17:30	1.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole from 106m to 115m no circ.
17:30 - 18:45	1.25	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : build volume
18:45 - 19:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	40	REAMING : from 106m to 115m
19:00 - 20:00	1.00	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h. to run plug # 3
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test Annular
20:30 - 21:00	0.50	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : r.i.h. opened
21:00 - 21:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING : rig crew & Sanjel
21:15 - 00:00	2.75	O	S-DRL	83	WAITING OTHER : Sanjel to batch mix cmt. for plug , cmt. De-hydrated could not pump cmt. down hole . Slush out , drain all lines and pumper.

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/26/2005 Report: 5 DFS: 5.00 DOL: 10.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 143.0 (m) TVD: 143.0 (m) Progress: 28.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 1.75 AV ROP: 16.00 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 89,683 Cum Cost: 2,613,019 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Reaming hole to get drill pipe in to run cmt plug

24hr Summary: Run plug #3 in surface hole , w.o.c. , tag plug top @ 70mkb . drill out cmt. Drill ahead 311mm surface hole f. 115m to 143m . Cir

24hr Forecast: Ream hole , run plug w.o.c.

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test Annular
00:15 - 04:30	4.25	O	S-DRL	83	WAITING OTHER : Sanjel to get rdy , had to flush pumper out from trying to pump plug
04:30 - 04:45	0.25	O	S-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON : run plug # 3 from 115m to 75m
04:45 - 08:00	3.25	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test HCR
08:15 - 14:00	5.75	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT
14:00 - 15:15	1.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : r.i.h. & tag cmt. @ 70m
15:15 - 17:30	2.25	O	S-DRL	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT
17:30 - 17:45	0.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole blind without returns from 115m to 116m
17:45 - 18:30	0.75	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : condition mud w / parcial returns
18:30 - 20:00	1.50	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm hole from 116m to 143m parcial / blind
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
20:30 - 22:45	2.25	O	S-DRL	83	WAITING OTHER : bulk cmt.
22:45 - 00:00	1.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : P.o.o.h. to run plugs , tight hole from 57m to 30m pump out

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/27/2005 Report: 6 DFS: 6.00 DOL: 11.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 143.0 (m) TVD: 143.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 91,675 Cum Cost: 2,704,693 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: W.o.c,

24hr Summary: Finish p.o.o.h. , ream f. 20m to 143m . P.o.o.h. , run plug # 4 & plug # 5 . P.o.o.h. & w.o.c.

24hr Forecast: W.o.c., drill out cmt. plug & drill ahead 311mm surface hole

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test Annular
00:15 - 03:45	3.50	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : Finish p.o.o.h. , tight hole had to pump out 57m to 20m
03:45 - 05:00	1.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : try to r.i.h. open end bridge off @ 20m , p.o.o.h. r.i.h. w / bit
05:00 - 17:15	12.25	O	S-DRL	40	REAMING : from 20m to 143m
17:15 - 19:00	1.75	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h. to run plug # 4
19:00 - 20:00	1.00	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : r.i.h. open end to run plug
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
20:30 - 20:45	0.25	O	S-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON : rig up Sanjel
20:45 - 21:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING : with rig crew & Sanjel
21:00 - 23:00	2.00	O	S-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON : plug # 4 from 143m to 70m (50%ex.) & plug # 5 from 103m to 38m (gauge hole)
23:00 - 00:00	1.00	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 02/28/2005 Report: 7 DFS: 7.00 DOL: 12.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 170.0 (m) TVD: 170.0 (m) Progress: 27.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 2.50 AV ROP: 10.80 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 136,920 Cum Cost: 2,841,614 AFE Est: 5,120,900 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole @ 193m

24hr Summary: W.o.c. , r.i.h. tag cmt. @ 63 mkb. Drill out cmt. f. 63m to 143m & drill ahead 311mm surface hole f. 143m to 170m

24hr Forecast: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
00:15 - 07:00	6.75	O	S-DRL	73	WAITING ON CEMENT
07:00 - 08:15	1.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : r.i.h. to tag cmt. @ 63mkb
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : annular
08:30 - 19:45	11.25	O	S-DRL	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT : f. 63m to 143m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : dispace hole to mud
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
20:30 - 21:00	0.50	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : condition mud
21:00 - 21:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY
21:15 - 00:00	2.75	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 143m to 170m

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/01/2005 Report: 8 DFS: 8.00 DOL: 13.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 252.0 (m) TVD: 252.0 (m) Progress: 82.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 18.75 AV ROP: 4.37 Hole Size: 0 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 86,646 Cum Cost: 2,928,259 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Drilling ahead 311mm surface hole @ 274m

24hr Summary: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole f. 170m to 206 m w / survey's . Trip for bit & drill ahead 311mm surface hole f. 206m to 252 m w

24hr Forecast: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
00:15 - 07:30	7.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 170m to 198m
07:30 - 08:00	0.50	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test HCR
08:15 - 09:15	1.00	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 198m to 206m
09:15 - 09:45	0.50	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : circ. bottoms up & sample
09:45 - 12:30	2.75	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : p.o.o.h. change bit & r.i.h. bridge off @ 97m w / no fill on bottom
12:30 - 19:45	7.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 206m to 234m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
20:30 - 20:45	0.25	O	S-DRL	83	WAITING OTHER : drilling break monitor well for flow / gain
20:45 - 00:00	3.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 234m to 252m

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

150

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/02/2005 Report: 9 DFS: 9.00 DOL: 14.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 320.0 (m) TVD: 320.0 (m) Progress: 68.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: ROLAND A BENOIT (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 18.75 AV ROP: 3.63 Hole Size: 311 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 60,198 Cum Cost: 2,988,457 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: Drilling ahead 311mm surface hole @ 350m

24hr Summary: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole from 252m to 291m . Trip for bit/rop . Drill ahead 311mm surface hole f. 291m to 320 m

24hr Forecast: Drill ahead 311mm surface hole

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f. 252m 276m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test HCR
08:15 - 12:30	4.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole f.276m to 219m
12:30 - 12:45	0.25	O	S-DRL	17	C & C - DRILLING : circ. bottoms up & sample up
12:45 - 13:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY
13:00 - 16:15	3.25	O	S-DRL	20	TRIPS : for bit & cond hole
16:15 - 20:00	3.75	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole from 219m to 305m
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE : function test annular
20:30 - 23:45	3.25	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING : ahead 311mm surface hole from 305m to 320m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/03/2005 Report: 10 DFS: 10.00 DOL: 15.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 362.0 (m) TVD: 362.0 (m) Progress: 42.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 8.50 AV ROP: 4.94 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: Shoe TMD: Shoe TVD:
 Daily Cost: 48,003 Cum Cost: 3,036,460 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: RUNNING 244.5mm CASING TO 205m

24hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD TO CASING DEPTH - 362m, WIPER TRIPS AND CONDITION MUD, POH TO RUN SURFACE CASING

24hr Forecast: RIG TO AND RUN 244.5mm CASING, CEMENT CASING, WOC

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 320m - 353m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY @ 326m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER
08:15 - 09:00	0.75	O	S-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 353m - 362m
09:00 - 09:30	0.50	O	S-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN AT CASING POINT
09:30 - 11:45	2.25	O	S-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO SURFACE. STRAP PIPE - 361.92m
11:45 - 14:00	2.25	O	S-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD FOR CASING. LARGE VOLUME OF CUTTINGS AFTER WIPER TRIP
14:00 - 14:15	0.25	O	S-DRL	16	SURVEY @ 355m
14:15 - 16:00	1.75	O	S-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO SURFACE. HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE
16:00 - 18:15	2.25	O	S-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD FOR CASING. SOME CUTTINGS AFTER WIPER TRIP. REDUCED BY 50% FROM WIPER TRIP #1
18:15 - 20:00	1.75	O	S-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO SURFACE. HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE
20:00 - 22:30	2.50	O	S-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD FOR CASING. VERY LITTLE CUTTINGS. MUD IN MUCH BETTER CONDITION
22:30 - 00:00	1.50	O	S-DRL	20	POH TO RUN SURFACE CASING

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS. HIGH WIND CHILL

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/04/2005 Report: 11 DFS: 11.00 DOL: 16.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 362.0 (m) TVD: 362.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 204,649 Cum Cost: 3,241,109 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: RIG IN BOPE

24hr Summary: RIG TO AND RUN 244.5mm CASING, CEMENT CASING, WOC, RIG OUT DIVERTOR, CUT CASING, RIG IN BOPE

24hr Forecast: RIG IN BOPE, PRESSURE TEST BOPE, CLEAN TANKS, MAKE UP BHA

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-CSG	50	RIG SERVICE
00:15 - 00:30	0.25	O	S-CSG	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH HALLMARK POWER TONGS AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR RIGGING IN POWER TONGS AND RUNNING CASING
00:30 - 01:30	1.00	O	S-CSG	70	RIG IN POWER TONGS AND RUN 244.5mm CASING TO 26m
01:30 - 04:00	2.50	N	S-CSG	70	LAY DOWN CASING JOINT #3. REMOVE COLLAR FROM JOINT #3 AND INSTALL ON JOINT #2 (FLOAT COLLAR JOINT). THAW CASING FILL-UP LINE
04:00 - 08:15	4.25	O	S-CSG	70	RUN 244.5mm CASING. HOLE TIGHT AT 112m, 160m. FILL ON BOTTOM = 2m
08:15 - 10:30	2.25	O	S-CSG	71	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD FOR CASING. REDUCE VISCOSITY TO 53 sec
10:30 - 10:45	0.25	O	S-CSG	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH SANGEL CEMENTERS, VACUUM TRUCK OPERATOR, WATER TRUCK OPERATOR, AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR THE CEMENT JOB.
10:45 - 13:00	2.25	O	S-CSG	72	MIX AND DISPLACE 7.7 tonne GLACIAL MIX LEAD CEMENT AND 15.4 tonne EXPANDOMIX TAIL CEMENT. DISPLACE CEMENT WITH 9.5 m3 H2O. DISPLACEMENT STOPPED 4.5m3 EARLY DUE TO GOOD RETURNS OF GLACIAL MIX.
13:00 - 13:15	0.25	O	S-CSG	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH ENSIGN RIG CREW. DISCUSSED SECTION 6.2 FROM DEVON HSE HANDBOOK
13:15 - 20:00	6.75	O	S-CSG	73	WAITING ON CEMENT. OBSERVED ANNULUS DROP SLIGHTLY
20:00 - 00:00	4.00	O	S-CSG	75	RIG OUT DIVERTOR, ROUGH CUT CASING, REMOVE DIVERTOR SYSTEM. INSTALL CASING BOWL. RIG UP BOPE. MIX BY HAND APPROXIAMETLY 1 tonne GLACIAL MIX CEMENT AND POUR DOWN AROUND CASING. CEMENT HAD DROPPED ABOUT 2m. OBSERVED BUBBLING IN ANNULUS. TESTED CO2 AT 250 ppm
NO ACCIDENTS INCIDENT- VACUUM TRUCK BROKE AIR LINES AND HAS BEEN DOWN SINCE 1330 hr. WORKING TO REPAIR. UNABLE TO CLEAN MUD TANKS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/05/2005 Report: 12 DFS: 12.00 DOL: 17.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 362.0 (m) TVD: 362.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 130,106 Cum Cost: 3,371,215 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DRILLING GOOD FIRM CEMENT TO 285m

24hr Summary: RIG IN BOPE, PRESSURE TEST BOPE, CLEAN TANKS, DRILL OUT MOUSEHOLE

24hr Forecast: MAKE BHA & RIH TO 240m, DRILL CEMENT, PT CASING, DRILL OUT

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	50	RIG SERVICE
00:15 - 02:00	1.75	O	S-HUP	75	INSTALL CASING BOWL AND TEST SEALS TO 11000 kpa
02:00 - 08:00	6.00	O	S-HUP	75	NIPPLE UP BOPE
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR PICKING UP BOP SATAACK AND VALVES
08:15 - 14:00	5.75	O	S-HUP	75	NIPPLE UP BOPE
14:00 - 16:00	2.00	O	S-HUP	75	PRESSURE TEST MANIFOLD TO 1500 kpa LOW TEST AND 21000 kpa HIGH TEST
16:00 - 16:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR PRESSURE TESTING. REVIEWED ENSIGN JSA E-3
16:15 - 16:30	0.25	O	S-HUP	50	RIG SERVICE
16:30 - 23:00	6.50	O	S-HUP	75	PRESSURE TEST BLIND RAM, PIPE RAM, HCR, KILL LINE AND VALVES, CHECK VALVE, CHOKE AND VALVES, UPPER AND LOWER KELLY COCKS, INSIDE BOP, AND STABBING VALVE TO 1500 kpa LOW TEST AND 21000 kpa HIGH TEST. TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER TO 1500 kpa LOW TEST AND 11000 kpa HIGH TEST. CHECK MOTOR KILLS.
23:00 - 00:00	1.00	N	S-HUP	74	CLEAN MUD TANKS AND MIX MUD FOR MAINHOLE DRILL OUT CEMENT FROM MOUSEHOLE. (MOUSEHOLE WAS CEMENTED WHEN CEMENT WAS PUMPED TO REPAIR CELLAR AREA. NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/05/2005 Report: 12 DFS: 12.00 DOL: 17.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

RELEASED SANGEL CREW AT 1300 hr

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/06/2005 Report: 13 DFS: 13.00 DOL: 18.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 370.0 (m) TVD: 370.0 (m) Progress: 8.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 1.00 AV ROP: 8.00 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 107,214 Cum Cost: 3,478,430 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: WORKING TIGHT CONNECTION AT 399m

24hr Summary: MAKE BHA & RIH TO 240m, DRILL CEMENT, PT CASING, DRILL OUT TO 365m, LEAK OFF TEST, DRILL TO 370m

24hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD, WIPER TRIP

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	50	RIG SERVICE
00:15 - 01:15	1.00	O	S-HUP	75	INSTALL WEAR BUSHING
01:15 - 02:00	0.75	O	S-HUP	75	INSTALL FLOW NIPPLE
02:00 - 03:00	1.00	O	S-HUP	20	RIH WITH BHA AND TAG CEMENT @ 240m
03:00 - 03:45	0.75	O	S-HUP	20	LAY DOWN 5 std OF DRILL PIPE
03:45 - 08:00	4.25	O	S-HUP	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT FROM 240m - 319m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW. REVIEWED JSA F-5 AND 5-6
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	S-HUP	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:30 - 10:30	2.00	O	S-HUP	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT FROM 319m - 349m
10:30 - 10:45	0.25	O	S-HUP	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
10:45 - 13:15	2.50	O	S-HUP	76	PRESSURE TEST CASING TO 16000 kpa. PERFORM ACCUMULATOR FUNCTION TEST WITH FALCON TESTER, RIG MANAGER, DRILLER, AND DEVON REP.
13:15 - 13:30	0.25	O	S-HUP	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT FROM 349m - 356m
13:30 - 16:30	3.00	O	S-HUP	17	DISPLACE HOLE TO 1150 kg/m3 MUD. CLEAN MUD TANK CONDITION MUD AND BUILD VOLUME
16:30 - 18:15	1.75	O	S-HUP	22	JACK RIG TO LEVEL
18:15 - 18:30	0.25	O	S-HUP	91	BOP DRILL - TRIP DRILL. HELD WITH RIG CREW AND DEVON REPCREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE IN 120 sec
18:30 - 20:00	1.50	O	S-HUP	20	POOH TO PICK UP DRILLING JAR
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	S-HUP	91	BOP DRILL - TRIP DRILL. HELD WITH RIG CREW AND DEVON REPCREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE IN 120 sec
20:15 - 20:45	0.50	O	S-HUP	20	RIH TO 356m
20:45 - 22:00	1.25	O	S-HUP	74	DRILL OUT CEMENT FROM 356m - 362m. DRILL OUT FLOAT SHOE AT 360.5m
22:00 - 22:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 362m - 365m
22:15 - 23:15	1.00	O	P-DRL	76	PERFORM FORMATION INTEGRITY TEST. FORMATION BROKE DOWN AT 2500 kpa SURFACE APPLIED PRESSURE WITH 1150 kg/m3 DENSITY FLUID - 18.1 kg/m
23:15 - 00:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 365m - 370m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	2,500	1,150.0	SURFACE		Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
					Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/06/2005 Report: 13 DFS: 13.00 DOL: 18.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

RELEASED FALCON PRESSURE TESTERS

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/07/2005 Report: 14 DFS: 14.00 DOL: 19.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 449.0 (m) TVD: 449.0 (m) Progress: 79.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 20.25 AV ROP: 3.90 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 66,138 Cum Cost: 3,544,568 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DRILLING TO 456m @ 1.0 m/hr

24hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD FROM 370m - 449m

24hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD, TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
00:15 - 01:15	1.00	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 364m - 356m. PULLED TIGHT INTO CASING
01:15 - 05:30	4.25	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 371m - 399m
05:30 - 06:15	0.75	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND WORK TIGHT HOLE FROM 395m - 380m
06:15 - 08:00	1.75	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 399m - 408m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:30 - 19:30	11.00	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 408m - 439m
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	H2S MAN DOWN DRILL. CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE 4 min 30 sec.
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	DISCUSSED PROCEDURES WITH ALL PRESENT
20:30 - 00:00	3.50		P-DRL	10	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec) DRILLING FROM 439m - 449m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	18/40.00
1,853.98	2,287	1,210.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/980.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/07/2005 Report: 14 DFS: 14.00 DOL: 19.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

DEVIATION PROBLEM

THE WELLBORE HAS DEVIATED FROM 1.75 DEGREES AT 326m OUT TO 4.25 DEGREES AT 424m

DRILLING PARAMETERS FROM 326m - 362m - WOB 6-8 daN RPM 140 (311mm HOLE)

FROM 362m - 400m WOB 6-7 daN RPM 125 (222mm HOLE)

FROM 400m - 429m WOB 5-6 daN RPM 130 (222mm HOLE)

FROM 429m - 449m WOB 4-5 daN RPM 140 (222mm HOLE)

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/08/2005 Report: 15 DFS: 15.00 DOL: 20.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 485.0 (m) TVD: 485.0 (m) Progress: 36.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 18.00 AV ROP: 2.00 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 58,902 Cum Cost: 3,603,470 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: MAKE UP FISHING ASSEMBLY

24hr Summary: DRILL FROM 449m - 457m, TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE (HOLE GOOD), DRILL FROM 457m - 485m

24hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD TO 486m, TWIST OFF DC- 2 DOWN FROM HWDP, FISHING

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8sec)
00:15 - 07:30	7.25	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 449m - 457m
07:30 - 08:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN AND MIX PILL
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
08:30 - 10:30	2.00	O	P-DRL	20	POOH FOR BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 453m, 359m, 101m AND OUT OF HOLE. HOLE GOOD ON TRIP OUT
10:30 - 12:00	1.50	O	P-DRL	20	HOLE FILL CALCULATION - 2.9 m3 MEASURED - 3.6 m3
12:00 - 14:30	2.50	O	P-DRL	10	MAKE UP BIT #5 AND RIH TO 454m. NO FILL ON BOTTOM
14:30 - 15:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	DRILLING ROM 457m - 465m
15:00 - 19:15	4.25	O	P-DRL	16	CIRCULATE AND SURVEY @ 453m MISRUN
19:15 - 19:45	0.50	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 465m - 475m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CIRCULATE AND SURVEY AT 463m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
20:00 - 00:00	4.00	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 475m - 485m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	16/40.00
1,853.98	2,251	1,220.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	16.00/20.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	16.00/30.00
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/09/2005 Report: 16 DFS: 16.00 DOL: 21.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 494.0 (m) TVD: 494.0 (m) Progress: 9.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 6.50 AV ROP: 1.38 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 65,716 Cum Cost: 3,669,186 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DRILLING AHEAD TO 501m @ 1.5 m/hr

24hr Summary: DRILL TO 486m, TWISTED OFF, POOH, RIH W/ OVERSHOT, ENGAGE FISH AND POH, RIH TO 484m, DRILL TO 494m

24hr Forecast: DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 01:15	1.25	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 485m - 486m. TWISTED OFF
01:15 - 01:45	0.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: CHECK ALL SURFACE EQUIPMENT
01:45 - 03:00	1.25	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: POOH TO PICK UP FISHING TOOLS. FLOW CHECK WELL 404m, 293m, 180m, AND OUT OF HOLE
03:00 - 08:00	5.00	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: MAKE UP 8 1/8"OVERSHOT, BUMPER SUB, BOWEN JAR AND PICK UP 1 REPLACEMENT DC
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: SAFETY MEETING WITH RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURE FOR RUNNING OVERSHOT, ENGAGEING FISH, AND PULLING FISH OUT OF THE HOLE
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
08:30 - 09:30	1.00	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: RIH WITH FISHING ASSEMBLY TO 404m
09:30 - 10:15	0.75	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP AND ENGAGE FISH AND PULL FREE
10:15 - 12:45	2.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: POOH WITH FISH. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 483m, 388m, 116m, AND OUT OF HOLE.
12:45 - 15:15	2.50	N	P-DRL	45	HOLE FILL CALCULATION 3.39 m3 MEASURED 3.86 m3 FISHING: ATTEMPT TO RELEASE OVERSHOT FROM FISH, LAY DOWN ALL FISHING TOOLS
15:15 - 17:00	1.75	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: MAKE UP BIT#5 AND RERUN. BREAK, REDOPE, TORQUE, AND VISUALLY INSPECT ALL DRILL COLLAR CONNECTIONS WHILE RIH
17:00 - 18:00	1.00	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: RIH TO 485m. LAY DOWN TWO BENT JOINTS OF DRILL PIPE
18:00 - 18:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: INSTALL RETURN FLOW MONITORING SYSTEM
18:30 - 21:15	2.75	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 486m - 490m
21:15 - 21:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	HELD BOP DRILL - MAN DOWN DRILL WITH NEW CREW
21:30 - 00:00	2.50	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 490m - 494m

NO ACCIDENTS
 INCIDENT - DRILL COLLAR FAILURE
 NO OPERATIONAL TIME = 16.75 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,251	1,220.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/10/2005 Report: 17 DFS: 17.00 DOL: 22.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 526.0 (m) TVD: 526.0 (m) Progress: 32.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 22.25 AV ROP: 1.44 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 48,217 Cum Cost: 3,717,403 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: CIRCULATING AT 343m WHILE WAITING ON OVERSHOT FROM INUVIK

24hr Summary: DRILL AHEAD FROM 494m - 526m

24hr Forecast: DRILL TO 527m, POOH FOR TWIST OFF, RIH TO SHOE, W/O OVERSHOT

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
00:15 - 08:00	7.75	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 494m - 502m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (4 sec)
08:30 - 19:30	11.00	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 502m - 519m
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	SURVEY AND CIRCULATION TIME @ 492m
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING: H2S AND MAN DOWN DRILL.
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
20:30 - 00:00	3.50	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 519m - 526m
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,322	1,200.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/30.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/10/2005 Report: 17 DFS: 17.00 DOL: 22.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

CELLAR AREA DETERIORATION

THE LAST 24 HOURS THERE HAS BEEN A NOTICABLE DETERIORATION OF THE AREA AROUND THE CELLAR. THE BOP STACK IS TURNBUCKLED AND THERE IS VERY LITTLE MOVEMENT BUT THE MOVEMENT THAT THERE IS CAUSES THE ENTIRE AREA UNDER THE CELLAR TO MOVE. ROTARY SPEEDS WERE ADJUSTED UP AND DOWN AND IT WAS DETERMINED THAT THE LEAST MOVEMENT WAS AT ABOUT 110 RPM. DRILLING PARAMETERS WERE CHANGED TO 110 RPM.

LOOKING AT THE CELLAR FROM THE V DOOR END. THERE IS A PIECE OF CEMENT MISSING FROM 9 O'CLOCK TO 7 O'CLOCK. THERE IS A GAP 10cm - 15 cm BETWEEN THE CEMENT AND THE CELLAR FROM 7 O'CLOCK TO 3 O'CLOCK. THERE IS A CRACK ABOUT 10 cm THAT GOES FROM THE 3 O'CLOCK POSITION UNDER THE MATTING. THERE IS WATER VISIBLE BETWEEN THE CEMENT AND THE CELLAR DOWN ABOUT 1.5m.

ORDERED 20 tonne OF GLACIAL MIX CEMENT FROM SANGEL FT ST JOHN. REQUESTED 2 DRIVERS AND A PUMPING CREW AT 22:30 HRS

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/11/2005 Report: 18 DFS: 18.00 DOL: 23.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 527.0 (m) TVD: 527.0 (m) Progress: 1.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 0.25 AV ROP: 4.00 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 47,027 Cum Cost: 3,764,429 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: CIRCULATING AT CASING SHOE WAITING ON DC INSPECTION

24hr Summary: DRILL TO 527m, TWIST OFF, POOH, RIH FISHING ASSEMBLY, ENGAGE FISH, POOH WITH FISH, RIH TO 355m, CIRC

24hr Forecast: CIRC AND WAIT ON DC INSPECTOR,

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION PIPE RAMS (3 sec)
00:15 - 00:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	10	DRILLING FROM 526m - 527m. TWISTED OFF DRILL STRING. LOST 4 daN
00:30 - 01:00	0.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
01:00 - 03:30	2.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: POOH TO LAY DOWN DAMAGED TOOL. LEFT IN THE HOLE 4 DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB, AND BIT. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 515m, 415m, 155m, AND OUT OF HOLE.
03:30 - 04:45	1.25	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: LAY DOWN DRILL COLLAR #5 (FROM BIT). PIN BROKE OFF 2.5 cm FROM FACE. MAKE UP BIT, BIT SUB, AND RIH TO 344m
04:45 - 08:00	3.25	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON OVERSHOT FROM INUVIK. NO PIPE MOVEMENT WHILE CIRCULATING
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION STABBING VALVE
08:30 - 10:00	1.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON OVERSHOT FROM INUVIK. NO PIPE MOVEMENT WHILE CIRCULATING
10:00 - 11:45	1.75	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: POOH TO PICK UP FISHING ASSEMBLY. FLOW CHECK WELL @ 350m, 171m, AND OUT OF HOLE
11:45 - 12:30	0.75	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: MAKE UP 8 1/8" OVERSHOT DRESSED WITH 6 1/4 BASKET GRAPPLE AND MILL CONTROL. PICK UP BUMPER SUB AND BOWEN JAR
12:30 - 15:15	2.75	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: RIH TO TOP OF FISH @
15:15 - 16:15	1.00	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: ENGUAGE FISH, PULL FREE AND CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP. SOME GAS CUT MUD VISABLE AT BOTTOMS UP
16:15 - 18:30	2.25	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: POOH WITH FISH FLOW CHECK WELL AT 527m, 400m, 170m, AND OUT OF HOLE. HOLE FILL CALCULATION - 3.64m3 MEASURED - 3.81m3. HOLE IS IN EXCELLENT CONDITION
18:30 - 20:00	1.50	N	P-DRL	45	FISHING: DISENGAGE OVERSHOT, LAY DOWN FAILED DC, LAY DOWN FISHING ASSEMBLY
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (4 sec)
20:30 - 21:00	0.50	N	P-DRL	20	TRIPS: RIH TO 355m.
21:00 - 00:00	3.00	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING FOR DRILL COLLAR INSPECTION PERSONNEL AND EQUIPMENT. CIRCULATING AT REDUCED RATE. NO PIPE MOVEMENT WHILE CIRCULATING.

NO ACCIDENTS
 INCIDENT - DRILL COLLAR FAILURE
 NON OPERATIONAL TIME 23.50 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,322	1,200.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/30.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/11/2005 Report: 18 DFS: 18.00 DOL: 23.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

DRILL COLLAR FAILURE #2

WHILE ON-BOTTOM DRILLING AT 527m THE DRILLER OBSERVED A REDUCTION IN PUMP PRESSURE. WHEN THE DRILL STRING WAS PICKED UP OFF BOTTOM, STRING WIEGHT WAS 4 daN LOWER. THE DRILL STRING WAS PULLED OUT OF THE HOLE. FOUR DRILL COLLARS, THE BIT SUB AND BIT WERE MISSING. DRILL COLLAR #5 WAS BROKE OFF 2.5 cm ON THE PIN END.

MADE UP A BIT, BIT SUB, AND RIH TO 344m. CIRCULATE AND WAIT ON OVERSHOT FROM INUVIK. (PLANE COULD NOT FLY YESTERDAY DUE TO HIGH WIND.)

AN 8 1/8" OVERSHOT WAS DRESSED WITH A BASKET GRAPPLE AND RUN IN TO TOP OF FISH AT 489m. FISH WAS ENGAGED AND PULLED FREE. CIRCULATED BOTTOMS UP. PULLED OUT OF THE HOLE WITH FISH AND LAYED DOWN DAMAGED DRILL COLLAR. THERE WAS NO DAMAGE TO THE FISHING TOOLS.

CELLAR AREA DETERIORATION

THE CELLAR AREA DETERIORATED BADLY OVER THE LAST 24 HOURS. CHECKED AREAS UNDER MATTING AROUND CELLAR, ALONG SUBSTRUCTURE, AND UNDER #1 PUMP. IT APPEARS THAT THERE IS STILL GOOD COMPETENT MATERIAL UNDER THE SUBSTRUCTURE. WATER IS VISABLE ALONG SIDE OF CELLAR CRIBBING. TOOLS PLACED IN THE MOUSEHOLE NOW COME OUT COVERED WITH THICK MUD AS COMPARED TO ICED 48 HOURS PREVIOUS.

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/12/2005 Report: 19 DFS: 19.00 DOL: 24.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 527.0 (m) TVD: 527.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 50,982 Cum Cost: 3,815,411 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: CIRCULATING AT 355m WHILE WAITING FOT TOOLS

24hr Summary: WAIT ON DC INSPECTOR & INSULATORS, INSPECT DC'S & HWDP - 4 DC'S, 1 HWDP, JARS CRACKED CONNECTIONS

24hr Forecast: RIH 350m, WAIT ON INSULATORS AND TOOLS, POH

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
00:15 - 08:00	7.75	N	P-DRL	83	CIRCULATE AT 350m WHILE WAITING ON DRILL COLLAR INSPECTOR. NO PIPE MOVEMENT
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
08:30 - 16:15	7.75	N	P-DRL	83	CIRCULATE AT 350m WHILE WAITING ON DRILL COLLAR INSPECTOR. NO PIPE MOVEMENT
16:15 - 17:30	1.25	N	P-DRL	20	POOH TO HWDP. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 352m, 257m, 165m
17:30 - 00:00	6.50	N	P-DRL	22	RIG IN DRILL COLLAR INSPECTOR AND INSPECT 10 HWDP AND 8 DRILL COLLARS, AND THE DRILLING JAR. FAILED 1 HWDP, 4 DRILL COLLARS, AND THE JAR WITH CRACKED PINS OR BOXES. RIG OUT DRILL COLLAR INSPECTOR
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 24 hr					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,305	1,205.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/30.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/13/2005 Report: 20 DFS: 20.00 DOL: 25.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 527.0 (m) TVD: 527.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 104,649 Cum Cost: 3,920,060 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: WAITING ON DRILLING JAR

24hr Summary: RIH 350m, WAIT ON INSULATORS AND TOOLS, POH, INSULATE CELLAR AREA , MAKE UP DIRECTIONAL BHA

24hr Forecast: MAKE BHA, WAIT ON JAR, MAKE UP JAR, RIH, DIRECTIONAL DRILL

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
00:15 - 02:15	2.00	N	P-DRL	20	RIH TO 350m
02:15 - 08:00	5.75	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING ON INSULATORS FROM INUVIK (ROAD CLOSED), DIRECTIONAL TOOLS FROM CALGARY, REPLACEMENT DRILL COLLARS FROM GRANDE PRAIRIE, AND DRILLING JAR FROM FORT NELSON
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION EMERGENCY MOTOR SHUT DOWNS
08:30 - 13:30	5.00	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING ON INSULATORS FROM INUVIK (ROAD CLEAR AT 12:00 hr), DIRECTIONAL TOOLS FROM CALGARY, REPLACEMENT DRILL COLLARS FROM GRANDE PRAIRIE, AND DRILLING JAR FROM FORT NELSON
13:30 - 13:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	H2S BOP DRILL WITH MAN DOWN. CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE 90 sec. MAN DOWN LOCATED AND MOVED TO BRIEFING AREA 4 min
13:45 - 19:00	5.25	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING ON INSULATORS FROM INUVIK, DIRECTIONAL TOOLS ARRIVED AT 1400 hr, REPLACEMENT DRILL COLLARS ARRIVED AT 1600 hr. INSULATORS ARRIVED AT 1900 hr
19:00 - 21:00	2.00	N	P-DRL	83	RIG IN INSULATORS AND START INSULATING CELLAR AREA
21:00 - 21:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
21:15 - 22:45	1.50	N	P-DRL	20	POOH TO PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 357m, 261m, 156m AND OUT OF HOLE
22:45 - 00:00	1.25	N	P-DRL	22	PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 23.75 hr					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,305	1,205.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/30.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/13/2005 Report: 20 DFS: 20.00 DOL: 25.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

CELLAR DETERIORATION PROBLEM

THE ENTIRE CELLAR AREA AROUND THE CRIBBING WAS FILLED IN WITH FOAM INSULATION. THE WASHED AREAS UNDER THE MATTING WERE FILLED IN AND THE FOAM ANGLED BACK SO THAT ALL LIQUID WILL BE DIVERETED INTO THE CELLAR. LOOKS REAL GOOD.

FILLED IN THE ENTIRE AREA UNDER #1 WITH THE FOAM. SHOULD STOP FURTHER MELTING

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/14/2005 Report: 21 DFS: 21.00 DOL: 26.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 560.0 (m) TVD: 560.0 (m) Progress: 33.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 9.00 AV ROP: 3.67 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 67,104 Cum Cost: 3,987,164 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 581m @ 4 -5 m/hr
 24hr Summary: MAKE BHA, WAIT ON JAR, RIHTO 527m, DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO 533m, TRIP FOR JARS, DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO 560m
 24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
00:15 - 03:00	2.75	N	P-DRL	22	PICK UP DIRECTIONAL TOOLS AND 9 DRILL COLLARS. SET MOTOR AT 1.5 DEGREES
03:00 - 03:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	BOP DRILL WHILE TRIPPING COLLARS. CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE 110 sec
03:15 - 08:30	5.25	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING ON DRILLING JAR
08:30 - 08:45	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:45 - 09:00	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION ANNULAR PREVENTER (7 sec)
09:00 - 10:15	1.25	N	P-DRL	20	RIH TO WITH DIRECTIONAL ASSEMBLY TO 385m
10:15 - 10:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	16	PULSE TEST MWD AND CHECK SHOT SURVEY @ 369m INC - 2.6 AZM - 52.9
10:30 - 11:15	0.75	N	P-DRL	20	RIH TO WITH DIRECTIONAL ASSEMBLY TO 527m. HOLE GOOD AND NO FILL
11:15 - 13:30	2.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 527m - 533m
13:30 - 13:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	SURVEY @ 513m
13:45 - 16:30	2.75	O	P-DRL	20	TRIP TO PICK UP DRILLING JAR. HOLE GOOD
16:30 - 20:00	3.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 533m - 542m
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
20:30 - 23:45	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM FROM 542m -560m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
					NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 11 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,287	1,210.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/15/2005 Report: 22 DFS: 22.00 DOL: 27.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55	TMD: 636.0 (m)	TVD: 636.0 (m)	Progress: 76.0 (m)
	KB: 604.76 (m)	GL: 599.76 (m)	KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138	Rot. Hours: 22.25	AV ROP: 3.42	Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
Office Eng: DAVID QUINN	Last Casing: 244.50 (mm)	Shoe TMD: 362 (m)	Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
Daily Cost: 53,674	Cum Cost: 4,019,818	AFE Est: 4,994,000	AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 658m @ 4 m/hr

24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD FROM 560m - 636m

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 560m - 583m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 09:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 583m - 591m
09:00 - 09:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
09:15 - 19:45	10.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 591m - 620m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST FLARE TANK IGNITOR
20:30 - 23:30	3.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 620m - 636m
23:30 - 00:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,269	1,215.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/12.00
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/16/2005 Report: 23 DFS: 23.00 DOL: 28.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 705.0 (m) TVD: 705.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 18.75 AV ROP: Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 78,659 Cum Cost: 4,098,477 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 724m @ 3 - 3.5 m/hr (DENSITY 1290 kg/m3)
 24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 636m - 678m, CIRC FOR ERP CONFERENCE CALL, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 678m - 705m
 24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD, TRIP FOR A BIT CHANGE

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION PIPE RAM (3 sec) AND REMOTE CHOKE
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 636m - 661m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION STABBING VALVE
08:30 - 12:00	3.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 661m - 678m
12:00 - 15:15	3.25	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE WHILE DEVON WELLSITE SUPERVISOR AND ENSIGN RIG MANAGER ATTEND "EMERGENCY RESPONE PLAN " CONFERENCE CALL AT EAGLE PLAINS LODGE
15:15 - 15:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
15:30 - 16:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 678m - 681m
16:00 - 16:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
16:15 - 16:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING: RIG INSPECTION REVIEW
16:30 - 23:45	7.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 681m - 705m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	2,198	1,235.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/18.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/16/2005 Report: 23 DFS: 23.00 DOL: 28.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

DRILLING WAS STOPPED FOR 3 HOURS AND 15 MINUTES THIS AFTERNOON FOR A PRE ZONE ENTRY EMERGENCY RESPONSE PLAN CONFERENCE CALL WITH CALGARY OFFICE HELD IN THE EAGLE PLAINS LODGE. DISCUSSED THE EMERGENCY RESPONSE PLAN.

ATTENDING THE MEETING AT EAGLE PLAINS LODGE

- JOHN WILLIAMS - DEVON WELL SITE SUPERVISOR
- DAVE PIETRYZSKI - ENSIGN RIG MANAGER
- CAREY BRISBOIS - DEVON WELLSITE GEOLOGIST
- GREG BRANWELL - HI - STANDARD SAFETY
- JEFF HICKEY - HI - STANDARD SAFETY
- STAN McNEVIN - EAGLE PLAINS LODGE MANAGER
- JODY LANE - MI SWAGO

ATTENDING THE MEETING IN CALGARY

- DAVE QUINN - DRILLING ENGINEER
- RANDY FITSNER - EMERGENCY PREPAREDNESS LEADER
- PETER DEVENIS - CONSULTANT SUPPORT - EMERGENCY MANAGEMENT

RECEIVED CALL FROM KEN KNUTSON FROM YUKON ENVIRONMENT

WANTS TO INVESTIGATE WATER USAGE FROM JAN 30/05 - FEB 22/05

- DITNER VENTURES (WATER TRUCKS)
- DEVON WILDLIFE MONITORS
- DARREN FIELDS

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/17/2005 Report: 24 DFS: 24.00 DOL: 29.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 745.0 (m) TVD: 745.0 (m) Progress: 40.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 14.00 AV ROP: 2.86 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 247,122 Cum Cost: 4,345,599 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 753m @ 3 - 4 m/hr
 24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO 734m, TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO 745m, POH TO 350m, REPAIR SHAKER
 24hr Forecast: REPAIR SHALE SHAKER, RIH TO BOTTOM, DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
00:15 - 00:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
00:30 - 07:45	7.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 705m - 724m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION PIPE RAM (3 sec)
08:15 - 10:15	2.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 724m - 734m
10:15 - 10:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	SURVEY @ 718m
10:30 - 10:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
10:45 - 11:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	BOP DRILL: TRIP DRILL - CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE IN 100 sec. DISCUSSED SHUT-IN, OBSERVED AND EXPLAINED HCR VALVE, CHECKED VALVE SET UP IN CHOKE MANIFOLD
11:00 - 13:30	2.50	O	P-DRL	20	POOH FOR BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 724m, 260m, AND OUT OF HOLE. HOLE FILL CALCULATION 4.51 m3 MEASURED 4.88 m3
13:30 - 14:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	22	CHANGE BIT, EXAMINE MOTOR AND CHECK SCRIBE
14:00 - 16:15	2.25	O	P-DRL	20	RIH TO 714m
16:15 - 16:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	21	WASH TO BOTTOM FROM 714m - 734m. NO FILL
16:30 - 20:30	4.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 734m - 743m
20:30 - 20:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
20:45 - 21:30	0.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 743m - 745m
21:30 - 23:30	2.00	N	P-DRL	20	POOH TO CASING AT 350m TO REPAIR SHALE SHAKER. FLOW CHECK WELL @ 740m, 645m, AND 350m
23:30 - 00:00	0.50	N	P-DRL	52	REMOVE AND HAVE WELDER REPAIR VIBRATOR BAR FOR SHALE SHAKER
					NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 2.5 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	1,950	1,305.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/18.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/26.00
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58

Date: 03/18/2005 Report: 25 DFS: 25.00 DOL: 30.00

Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55	TMD: 767.0 (m)	TVD: 767.0 (m)	Progress: 22.0 (m)
	KB: 604.76 (m)	GL: 599.76 (m)	KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138	Rot. Hours: 8.25	AV ROP: 2.67	Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
Office Eng: DAVID QUINN	Last Casing: 244.50 (mm)	Shoe TMD: 362 (m)	Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
Daily Cost: 254,274	Cum Cost: 4,599,872	AFE Est: 4,994,000	AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 771m @ 3 m/hr

24hr Summary: REPAIR SHALE SHAKER, RIH TO BOTTOM, DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD TO 767m, WAIT ON SHAKER REPAIRS

24hr Forecast: REPAIR SHALE SHAKER, RIH TO BOTTOM, DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 01:30	1.50	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: REMOVE, WELD, AND REPLACE VIBRATOR BAR ON SHALE SHAKER
01:30 - 02:30	1.00	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: RIH TO 745m. HOLE GOOD
02:30 - 02:45	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
02:45 - 07:45	5.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 745m - 758m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	SURVEY @ 737m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE:FUNCTION EMERGENCY MOTOR SHUTDOWNS
08:15 - 08:45	0.50	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: CHANGE ROTATION ON SHALE SHAKER MOTORS
08:45 - 12:00	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 758m -767m
12:00 - 13:30	1.50	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: POH TO 350m TO REPAIR SHALE SHAKER. VIBRATOR BAR UNABLE TO BE REPAIRED
13:30 - 14:15	0.75	N	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING MAN DOWN DRILL - DERRICK RESCUE
14:15 - 20:00	5.75	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: WAIT ON REPLACEMENT VIBRATOR BAR FOR SHALE SHAKER
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	N	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	N	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION STABBING VALVE
20:30 - 00:00	3.50	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: WAIT ON REPLACEMENT VIBRATOR BAR FOR SHALE SHAKER

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS
NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 15.25 hr ** SEE REMARKS SECTION**

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	5/12.00
1,853.98	1,861	1,330.0	HART RIVER	385.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	5.00/18.00
			SURFACE		Trip Avg/Max (%)	
					H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/19/2005 Report: 26 DFS: 26.00 DOL: 31.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 825.0 (m) TVD: 824.0 (m) Progress: 58.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 17.75 AV ROP: 3.27 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 114,690 Cum Cost: 4,714,563 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 845m @ 3.5 m/hr

24hr Summary: REPAIR SHALE SHAKER, RIH TO BOTTOM, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 767m - 825m

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 02:30	2.50	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: REPLACE VIBRATOR BAR ON SHALE SHAKER
02:30 - 03:45	1.25	N	P-DRL	20	RIH TO BOTTOM. HOLE GOOD
03:45 - 04:30	0.75	N	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND ADJUST SHAKER. CHANGE SCREEN ON SHAKER TO 140 MESH. (OIL SHOW WHILE CIRCULATING)
04:30 - 07:45	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 767m -775m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:15 - 19:30	11.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 775m - 810m
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION PIPE RAM (4 sec)
20:30 - 23:45	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 810m - 825m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS
 NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 4.5 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	8/18.00
1,853.98	1,825	1,340.0	TOP (S3A)	806.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	8.00/18.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	8.00/14.00
			SURFACE		H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/20/2005 Report: 27 DFS: 27.00 DOL: 32.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 889.0 (m) TVD: 888.0 (m) Progress: 64.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 19.25 AV ROP: 3.32 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 51,439 Cum Cost: 4,766,002 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: POOH FOR BIT CHANGE - BIT DEPTH 60m

24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 825m - 852m, CIRC BOTTOMS UP, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 852m - 889m

24hr Forecast: WIPER TRIP TO 604m, TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 01:15	1.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 825m - 829m
01:15 - 01:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
01:30 - 07:45	6.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 829m - 852m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
08:15 - 08:45	0.50	O	P-DRL	31	CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP SAMPLE FROM DRILLING BREAK AT 852m
08:45 - 09:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING:REVIEW JSA K-1, K3
09:00 - 17:30	8.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 852m - 877m
17:30 - 19:30	2.00	N	P-DRL	52	RIG REPAIR: REPAIR CHIMO MONITORING SYSTEM
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:30 - 22:00	1.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 877m - 886m
22:00 - 22:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (7 sec)
22:15 - 00:00	1.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 886m - 889m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS
 NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 2 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	8/18.00
1,853.98	1,790	1,350.0	TOP (S3A)	806.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	8.00/52.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/21/2005 Report: 28 DFS: 28.00 DOL: 33.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 930.0 (m) TVD: 929.0 (m) Progress: 41.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 12.25 AV ROP: 3.35 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 66,230 Cum Cost: 4,832,472 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 949m @ 3 - 4 m/hr

24hr Summary: WIPER TRIP TO 604m, TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 889m - 930m

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
00:15 - 00:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
00:30 - 02:15	1.75	O	P-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO 604m. HOLE GOOD
02:15 - 03:15	1.00	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP TO MONITOR TRIP GAS. NO TRIP GAS. FLOW CHECK WELL @ 880m, PUMP PILL AND BLOW KELLY
03:15 - 06:30	3.25	O	P-DRL	20	POOH FOR BIT CHANGE
06:30 - 07:45	1.25	O	P-DRL	22	SERVICE MWD AND CHANGE ALL BATTERIES. SCRIBE TOOLS AND CHANGE BIT.
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 09:30	1.25	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #9 TO 889m. HOLE GOOD
09:30 - 09:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
09:45 - 18:45	9.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 889m - 914m
18:45 - 19:45	1.00	N	P-DRL	52	REPAIR CHIMO WELL MONITORING SYSTEM
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION STABBING VALVE
20:30 - 23:45	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 914m - 930m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 1 hr					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	8/42.00
1,853.98	1,790	1,350.0	TOP (S3A)	806.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	8.00/84.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/22/2005 Report: 29 DFS: 29.00 DOL: 34.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 994.0 (m) TVD: 993.0 (m) Progress: 64.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 20.00 AV ROP: 3.20 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 105,473 Cum Cost: 4,937,945 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING IN CHANCE SAND (998m) TO 1013m @ 3 - 5 m/hr
 24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 930m - 967m, DUMP 15m3 OF MUD & REPLACE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 967m - 994m
 24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 01:00	1.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 930m - 934m
01:00 - 01:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (7 sec)
01:15 - 07:45	6.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 934m - 952m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:30 - 13:15	4.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 952m - 967m
13:15 - 13:45	0.50	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
13:45 - 14:45	1.00	O	P-DRL	17	PUMP OUT 15 m3 OLD MUD AND REPLACE WITH FRESH PREMIX
14:45 - 19:30	4.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 967m - 977m
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING: REVIEW THE "BUDDY SYSTEM"
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION REMOTE CHOKE
20:30 - 23:30	3.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 977m - 994m
23:30 - 00:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	8/24.00
1,853.98	1,825	1,340.0	TOP (S3A)	882.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	8.00/35.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/23/2005 Report: 30 DFS: 30.00 DOL: 35.00
Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,051.0 (m) TVD: 1,050.0 (m) Progress: 57.0 (m)
KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 18.50 AV ROP: 3.08 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
Daily Cost: 48,396 Cum Cost: 4,986,341 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: RUNNING IN THE HOLE WITH BIT #10 TO 600m

24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 994m - 1051m, WIPER TRIP TO 950m, CIRC HOLE CLEAN, POOH FOR BIT CHANGE

24hr Forecast: TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 02:15	2.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 994m - 1000m
02:15 - 02:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION REMOTE CHOKE
02:30 - 07:45	5.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1000m - 1019m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:15 - 15:45	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1019m - 1041m
15:45 - 16:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
16:00 - 16:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
16:15 - 16:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING. ORIENTATION OF NEW EMPLOYEES BY HI-STANDARD SAFETY
16:30 - 20:00	3.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1041m - 1051m
20:00 - 20:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN
20:30 - 21:45	1.25	O	P-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO 950m. FLOW CHECK WELL AND BLOW KELLY. HOLE TIGHT AT 988m
21:45 - 23:00	1.25	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, FLOW CHECK WELL @ 1044m
23:00 - 00:00	1.00	O	P-DRL	20	POOH FOR BIT CHANGE. HOLE TIGHT AT 988m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	18/24.00
1,853.98	1,825	1,340.0	TOP (S3A)	882.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/62.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			SURFACE		H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/24/2005 Report: 31 DFS: 31.00 DOL: 36.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,088.0 (m) TVD: 1,087.0 (m) Progress: 37.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 14.25 AV ROP: 2.60 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 63,682 Cum Cost: 5,050,022 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 1103m @ 3 m/hr

24hr Summary: TRIP FOR BIT CHANGE, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1051m - 1088m

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 03:00	3.00	O	P-DRL	20	POOH FOR BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL @ 575m, 185m AND OUT OF HOLE. HOLE FILL CALCULATION 7.40 m3 MEASURED 7.87 m3
03:00 - 03:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH OMNI DIRECTIONAL AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR LAYING DOWN, PICKING UP, AND ORIENTING MOTOR
03:15 - 04:15	1.00	O	P-DRL	22	LAY DOWN MOTOR, PICK UP REPLACEMENT MOTOR AND CHANGE OUT BIT. SET MOTOR AT 1.5 DEGREES
04:15 - 04:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
04:30 - 06:00	1.50	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #10 TO 600m
06:00 - 06:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	FILL PIPE AND PULSE TEST MWD
06:15 - 07:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #10 TO 1051m, HOLE GOOD. NO FILL
07:00 - 08:00	1.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1051m - 1054m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH NEW CREW MEMBERS. HELD BOP DRILL - CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE IN 110 sec
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:30 - 14:30	6.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1054m - 1066m
14:30 - 14:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	H2S AND MAN DOWN DRILL. ALL ON LOCATION REPORTED IN 90 sec. WELL SECURE 60 sec. MAN RECOVERED 4 min
14:45 - 19:45	5.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1066m - 1081m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
20:15 - 22:00	1.75	N	P-DRL	52	REPAIR CHIMO WELL MONITORING SYSTEM
22:00 - 00:00	2.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1081m - 1088m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS
 NON OPERATIONAL TIME = 1.75 hr

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	12/18.00
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CHANCE	998.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/56.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	12.00/16.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/25/2005 Report: 32 DFS: 32.00 DOL: 37.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,121.0 (m) TVD: 1,120.0 (m) Progress: 33.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 13.25 AV ROP: 2.49 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 63,383 Cum Cost: 5,113,405 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 1141m @ 3 - 5 m/hr
 24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO 1102m, POOH TO EXAMINE MOTOR AND BIT, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1102m - 1121m
 24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
00:15 - 06:15	6.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1088m - 1102m
06:15 - 06:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
06:30 - 07:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN AND FLOW CHECK AT 1100m
07:00 - 08:00	1.00	O	P-DRL	20	POOH TO EXAMINE MOTOR SETTING AND BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1009m,
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 10:45	2.50	O	P-DRL	20	POOH TO EXAMINE MOTOR SETTING AND BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 525, 170m, AND OUT OF HOLE. HOLE FILL CALCULATION - 6.94 m3 MEASURED - 6.21 m3
10:45 - 11:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
11:00 - 11:45	0.75	O	P-DRL	22	MAKE UP BIT #11 AND EXAMINE MOTOR
11:45 - 13:00	1.25	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #11 TO 468m
13:00 - 13:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	51	SLIP & CUT
13:30 - 13:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	FILL PIPE AND PULSE TEST MWD
13:45 - 14:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	BOP DRILL WHILE TRIPPING. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES WITH THE THREE NEW CREW MEMBERS
14:00 - 15:30	1.50	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #11 TO 1102m. HOLE GOOD. NO FILL
15:30 - 19:45	4.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1102m - 1112m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
20:15 - 23:30	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1112m - 1121m
23:30 - 23:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING-
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	12/18.00
1,853.98	1,896	1,320.0	CHANCE	998.0	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/58.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	12.00/98.00
			HART RIVER	385.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/26/2005 Report: 33 DFS: 33.00 DOL: 38.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,197.0 (m) TVD: 1,195.4 (m) Progress: 76.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 22.00 AV ROP: 3.45 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 50,863 Cum Cost: 5,164,268 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 1211m @ 2 - 4 m/hr (SLIDING 41m THIS BIT RUN)

24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1121m - 1197m (SLIDES INCREASED FROM 3m - 4m - 5m - 6m)

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL AHEAD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1121m - 1149m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:30 - 19:45	11.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1149m - 1186m
19:45 - 20:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST REMOTE CHOKE
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:30 - 23:45	3.25	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1186m - 1197m
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	12/18.00
1,853.98	1,967	1,300.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/56.00
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/27/2005 Report: 34 DFS: 34.00 DOL: 39.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,238.0 (m) TVD: 1,236.0 (m) Progress: 41.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 15.00 AV ROP: 2.73 Hole Size: (mm) (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 66,004 Cum Cost: 5,230,272 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: DIRECTIONAL DRILLING TO 1260m AT 3.5 - 4 m/hr

24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1197m - 1234m, TRIP FOR BIT, DIRECTIONAL DRILL FROM 1234m - 1238m

24hr Forecast: DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO TD, POOH TO LOG

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 07:30	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1197m - 1216m
07:30 - 07:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
08:30 - 15:00	6.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1216m - 1234m
15:00 - 16:15	1.25	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN, FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1229m, PUMP PILL AND BLOW KELLY
16:15 - 19:30	3.25	O	P-DRL	20	POH FOR BIT CHANGE. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1125m, 566m, 177m, AND OUT OF HOLE. (TIGHT HOLE 994m - 988m) HOLE FILL CALCULATION - 7.53 m3 MEASURED - 7.70 m3
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	22	CHANGE BIT AND EXAMINE MOTOR
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
20:30 - 21:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #12 TO 647m
21:00 - 21:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	PULSE TEST MWD TOOL
21:15 - 21:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	91	BOP DRILL WHILE TRIPPING. CREW IN POSITION AND WELL SECURE IN 90 sec
21:30 - 22:45	1.25	O	P-DRL	20	RIH WITH BIT #12 TO 1223m
22:45 - 23:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	21	WASH TO BOTTOM FROM 1223m - 1234m. NO FILL
23:00 - 00:00	1.00	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1234m - 1238m

NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	12/18.00
1,853.98	1,967	1,300.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	18.00/18.00
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/16.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/28/2005 Report: 35 DFS: 35.00 DOL: 40.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress: 40.0 (m)
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: 11.25 AV ROP: 3.56 Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 50,065 Cum Cost: 5,280,337 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: PULLING LOG RUN #2 DSI-HRLA-GR
 24hr Summary: DIRECTIONAL DRILL TO TD at 1278m, WIPER TRIP, CONDITION MUD, POOH TO LOG, RIG IN LOGGERS AND RUN #1
 24hr Forecast: LOG WITH SCHLUMBERGER

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST ANNULAR PREVENTER (8 sec)
00:15 - 07:45	7.50	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1238m - 1266m
07:45 - 08:00	0.25	O	P-DRL	16	CUMULATIVE MWD SURVEY TIME
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
08:30 - 12:15	3.75	O	P-DRL	11	DIRECTIONAL DRILLING FROM 1266m - 1278m
12:15 - 13:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE HOLE CLEAN AND FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1267m
13:00 - 15:00	2.00	O	P-DRL	20	WIPER TRIP TO 895m. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1175m, 895m. TIGHT SPOT AT 1144m ON POOH
15:00 - 17:00	2.00	O	P-DRL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD FOR LOGGING
17:00 - 20:00	3.00	O	P-DRL	20	POOH TO LOG. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1267m, 1165m, 623m, 177m, AND OUT OF HOLE. PIPE STRAP - 1278.17m. HOLE GOOD HOLE FILL CALCULATION - 7.65 m3 MEASURED - 7.47 m3
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH OMNI DIRECTIONAL DRILLER. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR BREAKING AND LAYING OUT DIRECTIONAL TOOLS
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
20:30 - 21:15	0.75	O	P-DRL	22	LAY DOWN DIRECTIONAL TOOLS, SHOCK SUB, AND JAR
21:15 - 21:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH SCHLUMBERGER AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR RIGGING IN LOGGERS, CREW POSITIONS WHEN WORKING WITH A SOURCE, OPERATIONAL PROCEDURES
21:30 - 22:15	0.75	O	P-EVAL	60	RIG IN SCHLUMBERGER AND MAKE UP TOOLS
22:15 - 00:00	1.75	O	P-EVAL	60	LOG: RUN #1 AIT-TLD-H6NS-LDS. LOGGER TD = 1278m LOGGER CASING SHOE 361m
NO ACCIDENTS OR INCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	12/18.00
1,853.98	1,914	1,315.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	12.00/18.00
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/52.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/29/2005 Report: 36 DFS: 36.00 DOL: 41.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: JOHN WILLIAMS (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 505,948 Cum Cost: 5,786,285 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1270m FOR POOH TO RUN DST #1

24hr Summary: LOG WITH SCHLUMBERGER, RIH TO BOTTOM, CIRCULATE, WIPER TRIP, CIRCULATE/ WAIT ON DST SUPPORT EQUIP

24hr Forecast: CIRC/ WAIT ON DST SUPPORT EQUIP, POOH,MAKE UP AND RUN DST #1

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 03:15	3.25	O	P-EVAL	60	LOG: RUN #1 AIT-TLD-H6NS-LDS.
03:15 - 08:00	4.75	O	P-EVAL	60	LOG: RUN #2 DSI-HRLA-GR
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH SCHLUMBERGER AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES CREW POSITIONS WHEN WORKING WITH A SOURCE
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAMS (3 sec)
08:30 - 10:45	2.25	O	P-EVAL	81	WAITING ON ORDERS
10:45 - 11:15	0.50	O	P-EVAL	60	LAY DOWN TOOLS AND RIG OUT LOGGERS
11:15 - 14:00	2.75	O	P-EVAL	20	MAKE UP BIT AND RIH TO 856m FOR CLEAN OUT
14:00 - 14:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	17	FILL PIPE AND FLOW CHECK WELL AT 856m
14:15 - 15:15	1.00	O	P-EVAL	20	RIH TO 1262m FOR CLEAN OUT
15:15 - 15:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	21	WASH TO BOTTOM FROM 1262m -1278m
15:30 - 20:00	4.50	O	P-EVAL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR DRILL STEM TESTING
20:00 - 21:30	1.50	O	P-EVAL	20	WIPER TRIP TO 950m. HOLE IN GOOD SHAPE
21:30 - 23:45	2.25	O	P-EVAL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION HOLE FOR DRILL STEM TESTING WHILE WAITING FOR P-TANK, FLUID STORAGE TANK, AND SCRUBBER UNIT
23:45 - 00:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST PIPE RAM (3 sec)
NO INCIDENTS OR ACCIDENTS					

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/24.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/29/2005 Report: 36 DFS: 36.00 DOL: 41.00
Start: 02/02/2005 End:

Remarks

RELEASED OMNI DIRECTIONAL DRILLER, CONTINENTAL LAB MUD LOGGERS, AND WELLSITE GEOLOGIST. WILL TAKE CREW CHANGE FLIGHT TO INUVIK TOMORROW

BAKER HUGHES DRILL STEM TESTER AND TELEMETRY PERSONNEL ON LOCATION AND RIGGED UP. TOOLS THAWED AND CHECKED.

WILDLIFE MONITOR HARVEY KASSI HAS AN ABCESSSED TOOTH AND WILL MAKE THE FLIGHT TOMORROW FOR MEDICAL ATTENTION. SHOULD RETURN TOMORROW ON THE SCHEDULED CREW CHANGE FLIGHT

HL POWELL TRANSPORTING 60 m3 FLUID TANK AND H2S SCRUBBER UNIT CONTACTED THE RIG AT 2230 hr. THEY WERE IN WHITEHORSE FOR A MEAL AND FUEL. ETA - 1030 hr

THE P-TANK AND FLARE STACK WERE NORTH OF WATSON LAKE AT 2200 hr. ETA - 1200 hr

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 03/30/2005 Report: 37 DFS: 37.00 DOL: 42.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR:

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: J WILLIAMS E KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 61,878 Cum Cost: 5,848,163 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: RUN #3 DST

24hr Summary: CIR&COND, WAIT ON DST SUP/ EQUIP, POOH, MAKE UP AND RUN DST #1 & #2 RESET

24hr Forecast: RUN DST#2&3, POOH RECOVER FLUID F/DST#3, CHECK TOOLS,RIH

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
00:15 - 06:00	5.75	O	P-EVAL	17	CIRCULATE AND CONDITION MUD WHILE WAITING ON DST SUPPORT EQUIPMENT
06:00 - 08:00	2.00	O	P-EVAL	20	POOH TO RUN DST #1. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 1270m, 1177m
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	OPERATIONAL SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 09:45	1.50	O	P-EVAL	20	POOH TO RUN DST #1. FLOW CHECK WELL AT 609m, 214m
09:45 - 10:30	0.75	O	P-EVAL	22	LAY DOWN 5 DRILL COLLARS, BIT SUB AND BIT. FLOW CHECK WELL WHEN OUT OF HOLE
10:30 - 10:45	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE: FUNCTION TEST BLIND RAM (3 sec)
10:45 - 11:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING WITH BAKER TESTER AND RIG CREW. DISCUSSED PROCEDURES FOR PICKING UP AND MAKING UP DST TOOLS
11:00 - 14:30	3.50	O	P-EVAL	61	MAKE UP DST #1 INFLATE STRADDLE WITH TELEMETRY
14:30 - 18:30	4.00	O	P-EVAL	20	RIH WITH DST #1 STRAP IN. DIFFER= +0.23m
18:30 - 19:00	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DST#1, HEAD UP RIG IN CANADIAN SUB SURFACE P-TANK & FLARE STACK (SCRUBBER ON LOCATION)
19:00 - 19:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING, REVIEW J.S.A G-2
19:15 - 19:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	61	INFLATE PACKERS
19:30 - 22:30	3.00	O	P-EVAL	61	RUN DST#1 CLOSED CHAMBER S-1 SAND INTERVAL 1193 TO 1203m KB
22:30 - 23:15	0.75	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO SECOND DST INTERVAL
23:15 - 23:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
23:30 - 00:00	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	HEAD UP, INFLATE PACKERS FOR DST #2

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud Wt(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/24.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 03/31/2005 Report: 38 DFS: 38.00 DOL: 43.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 38,969 Cum Cost: 5,887,132 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: POOH WITH DST#5

24hr Summary: RUN DST#2, 3 & 4, POOH, RECOVER FLD, SERVICE TEST TOOLS, RIH, RUN DST#5

24hr Forecast: RUN DST#5, POOH, L/D TEST TOOLS, RIH, CIR&COND. MUD

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 03:15	3.25	O	P-EVAL	61	RUN DST #2 S3A-1 SAND INTERVAL 1041.0 TO 1051.0m KB
03:15 - 03:45	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DEFLATE PACKERS & PULL FREE
03:45 - 04:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 3RD DST INTERVAL
04:00 - 04:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
04:15 - 04:45	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	HEAD UP, INFLATE PACKERS FOR DST #3
04:45 - 08:00	3.25	O	P-EVAL	61	RUN DST #3 S3A-2 SAND INTERVAL 997.0 TO 1007.0m KB
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:45	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DEFLATE PACKERS & PULL FREE
08:45 - 09:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 4TH DST INTERVAL
					SAFETY MEETING
09:00 - 09:30	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	HEAD UP, INFLATE PACKERS FOR DST #4
09:30 - 12:00	2.50	O	P-EVAL	61	RUN DST #4 S3A-3 SAND INTERVAL 985.0 TO 995.0m KB
12:00 - 12:30	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DEFLATE PACKERS & PULL FREE
12:30 - 12:45	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
12:45 - 13:30	0.75	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO 866m (FLUID0
13:30 - 13:45	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
13:45 - 15:15	1.50	O	P-EVAL	61	REVERSE CIRCULATE FLUID RECOVERY 5.5m ³ (815m) 10 FLUID SAMPLES TAKEN 2 GAS SAMPLES TAKEN 2% H2S
15:15 - 15:45	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DIRECT CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
15:45 - 16:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE, FUNCTION ANNULAR C/O 7 SEC.
16:00 - 18:30	2.50	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT HOLE
18:30 - 20:00	1.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DUMP RECORDERS & SERVICE BAKERS TEST TOOLS UPPER & LOWER PACKERS IN EXCELLANT SHAPE
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 20:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE, FUNCTION ANNULAR C/O 8 SEC.
20:30 - 23:15	2.75	O	P-EVAL	61	MAKE UP DST#5 TEST INTERVAL 27m
23:15 - 00:00	0.75	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP IN HOLE

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/24.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 04/01/2005 Report: 39 DFS: 39.00 DOL: 44.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 208,185 Cum Cost: 6,095,317 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: WAIT ON SANJEL

24hr Summary: RUN DST#5,POOH,L/D TOOLS,RIH,CIR-COND,POOH,L/D HWDP&DC'S,RIH OEDP

24hr Forecast: RIH OEDP, CIRC/COND, PLUG BACK WELL

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 01:15	1.25	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP IN HOLE W/ DST #5 INFLATE STRADDLE WITH TELEMETRY
01:15 - 01:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
01:30 - 02:00	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	HEAD UP, INFLATE PACKERS FOR DST #5
02:00 - 05:15	3.25	O	P-EVAL	61	RUN DST #5 HART RIVER INTERVAL 427.0 TO 453.0m KB
05:15 - 05:45	0.50	O	P-EVAL	61	DEFLATE PACKERS & PULL FREE
05:45 - 06:00	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE
06:00 - 08:00	2.00	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE DST #5 160m FLUID (SWEET) COLLECT 6 MUD SAMPLES
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 11:30	3.25	O	P-EVAL	61	LAY DOWN TEST TOOLS PACKERS IN FAIR SHAPE
11:30 - 11:45	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE
11:45 - 14:15	2.50	O	P-EVAL	20	MAKE UP BIT & TRIP IN HOLE TO 734m KB
14:15 - 15:00	0.75	O	P-EVAL	17	BRK. CIRCULATION & CIRCULATE BOTTOMS UP
15:00 - 16:15	1.25	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP IN HOLE TO 1267m
16:15 - 16:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	21	WASH TO BOTTOM NO FILL.
16:30 - 19:15	2.75	O	P-EVAL	17	CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD
19:15 - 19:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	20	PUMP PILL & BLOW KELLY
19:30 - 20:00	0.50	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-EVAL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 22:00	1.75	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP OUT OF HOLE TO HWDP REG.FLOW CHECKS
22:00 - 23:15	1.25	O	P-EVAL	20	LAY DOWN HWDP & DC'S
23:15 - 23:30	0.25	O	P-EVAL	50	RIG SERVICE
23:30 - 00:00	0.50	O	P-EVAL	20	TRIP IN HOLE OEDP

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	5.00/24.00
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 04/02/2005 Report: 40 DFS: 40.00 DOL: 45.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 261,476 Cum Cost: 6,356,793 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: N/D BOP'S

24hr Summary: RIH OEDP, CIR/COND, WO CEMENTERS, RUN PLUGS 1,2,3,4,5 & 6 POOH FOR PLUG#7

24hr Forecast: RUN PLUG #7, L/D D/P, WASH STACK, N/D BOP'S, CLEAN MUD TNKS, R/R

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 02:00	2.00	O	P-DRL	20	TRIP IN HOLE OEDP, PICK UP 17 JNT'S OF DP
02:00 - 02:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE
02:15 - 05:15	3.00	O	P-DRL	79	CIRCULATE & CONDITION MUD & HOLE FOR PLUG BACK
05:15 - 08:00	2.75	N	P-DRL	83	WAITING SANJEL
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 08:30	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE
08:30 - 10:15	1.75	O	P-DRL	79	CIRCULATE ON BOTTOM, RIG IN SANJEL
10:15 - 12:00	1.75	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG#1 1278 TO 1068m 0-1-0"G" 0.3% CFL-3+0.5% SPC-2. 7.8TN, 6m³ SLY/VOL. @ 1901kg/m³
12:00 - 14:15	2.25	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 26 JNT'S OF DRILL PIPE. 1038m REVERSE CIRCULATE 2.5m³ CEMENT RETURN
14:15 - 15:45	1.50	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG#2 1038 TO 828m 0-1-0"G" 0.3% CFL-3+0.5% SPC-2. 7.8TN, SLY/VOL 6m³ @ 1901kg/m³
15:45 - 17:30	1.75	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 26 JNT'S OF DRILL PIPE 796m REVERSE CIRCULATE, 2.0m³ CEMENT RETURN
17:30 - 18:45	1.25	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG#3 796 TO 654m 0-1-0"G" 0.3% CFL-3+0.5% SPC-2. 7.8TN, SLY/VOL 6m³ @1901 kg/m³
18:45 - 19:45	1.00	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 18 JNT'S OF DRILL PIPE TO 625m REVERSE CIRCULATE 1.75m³ CEMENT RETURN
19:45 - 20:30	0.75	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG #4 625-475m 1-1-2 w/ 2%GEL+0.5%CFR. 7TN, SLY/VOL 6.7m³ @1646 kg/m³ 100% EXCESS
20:30 - 21:30	1.00	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 17 JNT'S OF D/P 625-464m REVERSE CIRCULATE 1.5m³ CEMENT RETURNS
21:30 - 22:00	0.50	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG #5 464-398m 1-1-2 w/ 2%gel+0.5%CFR. 7TN, SLY/VOL 6.7m³ @1646 kg/m³ 100% EXCESS
22:00 - 22:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 7 JNT'S OF D/P 464-398m REVERSE CIRCULATE 1m³ CEMENT RETURNS
22:30 - 23:15	0.75	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG #6 398-175m EXPANDO MIX w/ 3%LCCI. 12.7TN, SLY/VOL 11.44m³ @ 1770 kg/m³
23:15 - 00:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 24 JNT'S OF D/P 398m-170m

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98	1,932	1,310.0	CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 04/03/2005 Report: 41 DFS: 41.00 DOL: 46.00
 Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 743,165 Cum Cost: 7,099,958 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: TEAR OUT ENSIGN #55 (PREP. RIG FOR STACK OUT.)

24hr Summary: RUN PLUG#7, L/D D/P, N/D BOP, LOAD OUT RENT/EQUIP, RIG OUT, CLEAN M/TNKS, RELEASE RIG

24hr Forecast: TEAR OUT, P/R FOR RACKING, TEAR OUT W/MULLEN 3 BEDS+PICKER

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 00:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	50	RIG SERVICE
00:15 - 01:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	79	REVERSE CIRCULATE @ 170m 1.0m³ CEMENT RETURN
01:00 - 01:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
01:15 - 03:00	1.75	O	P-DRL	79	PLUG & ABANDON, PLUG #7 170m TO SURFACE GLACIAL 8TN, SLY/VOL=6m³ MIXED @ 1885 kg/m³ WELL CEMENTED FROM TD TO SURFACE.
03:00 - 03:30	0.50	O	P-DRL	79	L/D 18 JNT'S OF D/P
03:30 - 03:45	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
03:45 - 08:00	4.25	O	P-DRL	75	NIPPLE DOWN BOP'S. PREP FOR RACKING
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 10:30	2.25	O	P-DRL	03	RIG DOWN
10:30 - 13:00	2.50	O	P-DRL	03	1 LOAD OUT MUD VAN. (TRANSFER PRODUCT IN VAN F/WT) 2 TRUCKS, LOAD OUT 105 JNT'S 139.7mm CSG + 2 JNT'S 244.5mm CSG.+4 PALLETS OF MUD PRODUCT. 3 LOAD 5.5m³ OF DST FLUID + 2.5m³ OF HOT H2O USED TO FLUSH 400 bbl.TANK NOTE: COULD NOT PUMP 5.5m³ OF DST FLUID INTO CSG. IT WOULD FREEZE & CRACK CSG. 4 RIG OUT SCRUBBER, PREPARE FOR DEMOB.
13:00 - 20:00	7.00	O	P-DRL	03	RIG DOWN, CLEAN MUD TANKS
20:00 - 20:15	0.25	O	P-DRL	90	SAFETY MEETING
20:15 - 21:00	0.75	O	P-DRL	03	INSPECT DERRICK, CHAIN DOWN & PIN SUB L/D DERRICK
21:00 - 00:00	3.00	O	P-DRL	03	TEAR OUT RIG, CLEAN MUD TANKS, CLEAN UP RIG. ENSIGN RIG #55 RELEASED FOR LOCATION @ 23:59 HR'S 04/03/2005

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98			CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 04/03/2005 Report: 41 DFS: 41.00 DOL: 46.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End: 04/03/2005

Remarks

MI-SWACO MUD ENG. RELEASED FROM LOCATION 04/03/2005
 DITNER VENTURES RELEASED FROM LOCATION 04/03/2005 (WATER TRUCKS)
 SANJEL CEMENTERS RELEASED FROM LOCATION 04/03/2005
 DAVE QUINN LEFT LOCATION 1000 HR'S
 22 BOX TRUCK LOADS OF CUTTINGS HAULED OUT TO REMOTE SUMP FOR MIXING OFF.

FORMULA TANK SERVICE TICKET#257081 LOADED & HAULED OUT 5.5m³ DST FLUID
 + 2.5m³ HOT H2O USED TO FLUSH 60m³ TANK. TO CCS SILVERBERRY LOCATION
 16:7-88-20 W6 FOR DESPOSIL.

FORMULA TRANSPORT LTD. TICKET# 101499 + 110208 LOADED & HAULED OUT 105 JNT'S
 139.7mm CSG. + 2 JNT'S 244.5mm CSG + 4 PALLETS OF MI-SWACO MUD PRODUCTS.
 ABOVE CSG. TO PE-BEN DIMSDALE, AB & MUD PRODUCTS TO HL POWELL
 FORTNELSON, BC

FORMULA TRANSPORT LTD. TICKET# 110051 LOADED & HAULED OUT MI-SWACO
 MUD VAN S/N#V654 MUD PRODUCT MATERIAL TRANSFER # 27405
 TO HL POWELL YARD FORTNELSON, BC

TIME CHANGE 1 HOUR AHEAD.

ENSIGN RIG #55 RELEASED FROM LOCATION @ 23:59 04/03/2005

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 04/04/2005 Report: 42 DFS: 42.00 DOL: 47.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 93,805 Cum Cost: 7,193,763 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: WAIT ON DAY LIGHT
 24hr Summary: RIG DOWN, DE-ICE, TEAR OUT ENSIGN #55 W/ MULLEN
 24hr Forecast: SPLIT A-LEGS,LOAD OUT, ABANDON WELL

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 08:00	8.00	O	RDMO	03	RIG DOWN, CLEAN MUD TANKS, DE-ICE MATTING & RIG.
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	RDMO	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 12:00	3.75	O	RDMO	03	RIG DOWN, CLEAN MUD TANKS, DE-ICE MATTING & RIG. LOAD OUT RENTALS CHIMO,RAVEN,AM GAS,DST FLUID SAMPLES & B/H SAMPLERS, CSG BOWL, LITE TOWER 139.7mm CENTRALIZERS, 139.7mm F/C & F/SHOE.
12:00 - 12:15	0.25	O	RDMO	90	SAFETY MEETING
12:15 - 20:00	7.75	O	RDMO	03	TEAR OUT ENSIGN #55, SPOT LOADS ON LEVEL GROUND. WITH 2 BED TRUCKS, 1 POLE TRUCK, 1 PICKER TRAILER DOWN 4 FLAT TIRES ON FRNT. AXLE RACK RIG @ EAGLE PLAINS LODGE KM 370 ON DEMPSTER HWY. 8 LOADS RACK @ RACK SITE. 5 LAND TRACTOR TRAILERS FROM FORT ST.JOHN, BC BASE.
20:00 - 00:00	4.00	N	RDMO	82	WAITING ON DAYLIGHT

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m ³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m ³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98			CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58 Date: 04/05/2005 Report: 43 DFS: 43.00 DOL: 48.00
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING Spud: 02/02/2005 RR: 04/03/2005

Rig Name: ENSIGN DRILLING 55 TMD: 1,278.0 (m) TVD: 1,276.0 (m) Progress:
 KB: 604.76 (m) GL: 599.76 (m) KB to GL: 5.0 (m)
 Rig Super: EARL KING (403) 997 - 9138 Rot. Hours: AV ROP: Hole Size: 222 (mm)
 Office Eng: DAVID QUINN Last Casing: 244.50 (mm) Shoe TMD: 362 (m) Shoe TVD: 362.0 (m)
 Daily Cost: 85,275 Cum Cost: 7,279,038 AFE Est: 4,994,000 AFE No.: 05270083

Current Status: WAITING ON DAYLIGHT
 24hr Summary: SPLIT DERRICK, LOAD OUT, ABANDON WELL
 24hr Forecast: OVER NIGHT & TRAVEL

Operations Summary

From - To	Hours	Oper	Phase	Code	Description of Operations
00:00 - 08:00	8.00	N	RDMO	82	WAITING ON DAYLIGHT
08:00 - 08:15	0.25	O	RDMO	90	SAFETY MEETING
08:15 - 20:00	11.75	O	RDMO	01	MOVE RIG TO RACKSITE. 17 RIG LOADS 5 RIG LOADS TO GRANDE PRAIREI, AB & 1 LOAD TO NISKU. RECEIVED 6 MORE LAND TRACTOR TRAILERS F/ F.S.JOHN, BC TOTAL = 11 2 WELLSITES TO RAVEN F.S.JOHN, BC, 2 WELLSITES TO SUNDANCE EDMONTON, AB 1 R/M WELLSITE TO GRANDE PRAIREI, AB RECEIVED 5 RAVEN TRACTOR TRAILERS FROM F.S.JOHN, BC ALL RENTALS RETURNED TO RENTAL COMPANY'S.

LOT/FIT			Formation Data		Gas Readings	
EMW (kg/m³)	MAASP (kPa)	Max Mud W(kg/m³)	Formation Name	Top (m)	Conn Avg/Max (%)	
1,853.98			CANOE	1,083.5	Bkgr Avg/Max (%)	
			CHANCE	998.0	Trip Avg/Max (%)	
			TOP (S3A)	882.0	H2S (ppm)	

Daily Drilling Report

Well Name: DEVON EAGLE PLAINS K-58
 Event Name: ORIG DRILLING

Date: 04/05/2005 Report: 43 DFS: 43.00 DOL: 48.00
 Start: 02/02/2005 End: 04/03/2005

Remarks

ABANDON K-58, DIG DOWN W/ TRACKHOE 1.5m. CUT OFF 244.5mm CSG, DRESS & WELD CAP ON CSG. (WATER TIGHT) DIG OUT SPRAYED FOAM INSULATION AROUND WELL. FILL IN HOLE. FILL IN MOUSE & RAT HOLE. LOCATION CLEANED UP. CONSTRUCTION WILL COMPLETE THE FINAL CLEAN UP. REMOTE SUMP 1.5m FREEBOARD. SUMP TO TESTED & MIXED OFF. 2 WILDLIFE MONITORS TO WORK WITH CONSTRUCTION UNTIL FINAL CLEAN UP IS COMPLETED.									
AIR-STRIP : C-CAN, GEN.SET & LITES RIGGED OUT 04/05/2005 AREA CLEANED UP.									
ONE CREW TO FLY OUT 04/05/2005 @ 0900 HR'S. (7 MEN)									
REMAINDER (8 MEN) TO FLY OUT 04/05/2005 @ 0900 HR'S. AIR CRAFT TO FLY BACK TO HOME BASE.									
DRLG.FOREMAN D. TOKAR & E.KING TO DRIVER RENTAL TRUCKS BACK TO FORTNELSON, BC DRIVE HOME. (ETA @ RES: 04/08/2005)									
EARL KING WILL FINISH UP FINAL INVOICING ETC. FROM RES. FINAL REPORT WILL BE SENT IN TO DEVON HEAD OFFICE. D/F LEFT EAGLE PLAINS 04/06/2005 @ 0800 HR'S									
VAC. TRUCK RELEASED FROM LOCATION 04/05/2005 @ 0800 HR'S									
WELDER RELEASED FROM LOCATION 04/05/2005 @ 1400 HR'S									
MEDIC RELEASED FROM LOCATION @ 04/06/2005									